COMMISSIONERS’ ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTIONS OF CHAPTER 152 OF THE
COVINGTON CODE OF ORDINANCES TO UPDATE CITY DEPARTMENT
AND STAFF REFERENCES, UPDATE ENFORCEMENT PROCEDURES,
UPDATE FINE AMOUNTS FOR VIOLATIONS, AND REMOVE A
REDUNDANT SUBCHAPTER.

* * * *

WHEREAS, certain sections of Chapter 152 of the Covington Code of Ordinances
sets forth various regulations concerning building code enforcement and incorporation of
the International Property Maintenance Code; and

WHEREAS, City staff proposes various updates to sections of Chapter 152 to reflect
updated staff references, update enforcement procedures, update civil fine amounts for
violations, and remove a redundant subchapter.

NOW THEREFORE,
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY
OF COVINGTON, KENTON COUNTY, KENTUCKY:

Section 1

Section 152.02 of the Covington Code of Ordinances is hereby amended to read as
follows:

§ 152.02 BUILDING OFFICIAL.

(A) The administration of this subchapter shall be the responsibility of the [Direetor-of
Code-Enforeement] City Manager, or hisor}l  lesignee, in close cooperation with
the Fire Chief, the County Health Department, and other officials and agencies; he or she
may seek written opinions concerning the conditions of dwellings or other buildings.

(B) The [Birectorof-Code Enforeement| City Manager, or his or her designee, and
his or her assistants shall be free from personal liability for acts done in good faith in the
performance of official duties.

(C) The [Director-of-Code-Enforcement]| City Manager, or his or her designee, or
any one of his or her assistants shall not have a financial interest in the furnishing of labor,
material, or appliances for the construction, alteration, or maintenance of a building,
except where he or she is the owner, and shall not act as an agent for real estate sales,
leases, or rentals.

(D) Powers and duties.



(1) The [Director—of-Code mnforeement] ("*y .
designee, is authorized to conduct surveys and make mspections in any area ui
the community to determine compliance with this subchapter or other ordinance
he or she is empowered to enforce.

(2) The [Director—ef—CodeEnforeement] City Manager, or his or her
designee, shall investigate all complaints whether they be verbal, written, or in
the form of a petition alleging or charging that a violation of this subchapter exists
or that a building or dwelling is unfit or unsafe for human habitation or other
occupancy.

(3) For the purpose of making such surveys, inspections, and investigations, the
[Director-of CodeEnforeement]| City Manager, or his or her designee, and
his or her assistants are authorized, on identification and statement of purpose, to
enter, inspect, survey, and investigate between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00
p.m., or at any time if an emergency exists, or if requested by the owner or
occupant, all buildings, dwellings, dwelling units, rooming units, and general
premises. The owner or occupant of every building, dwelling, dwelling unit,
rooming unit and general premises, or the person in charge thereof, shall give the
[Director-of- Code Enforcement| City Manager, or his or her designee, free
access to such building, dwelling, dwelling unit, rooming unit, or general premises
for the purpose of such inspection, survey, or investigation.

(E) Records and reports. The [Direetor-ef Code Enforeement] ™y “ana~-r,
or hi- ~r »2r designee, shall keep records of all complaints received, inspection
reports, orders and complaints issued, and of other actions taken. The records shall
be available for public inspection. He or she shall prepare an annual report
including statistics based on the records kept.

Section 2

Section 152.04 of the Covington Code of Ordinances is hereby amended to read as
follows:

§ 152.04 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY.

(A) After the effective date of this subchapter, for any vacant building or building which
is ordered vacant. where a notice of violation of this subchapter has been issued by the
[Pirector-of-Code ..Horeement] 7ty Manager, or his or her designee, no person
shall re-occupy or let to another to re-occupy any dwelling, dwelling unit, rooming house,
or rooming unit in the building until a certificate of occupancy has been issued.

(B) The city, or its agent or designee, shall issue a certificate of occupancy in the
name of the owner as defined herein for every building in the city inspected and found to
be in conformity with this subchapter and other local and state housing and building
requirements




(C) A certificate of occupancy shall be issued within seven days after application
therefore or a statement shall be given, in writing, specifying the reasons why 2 ficate
of occupancy cannot be issued.

(D) Whenever any building is found to contain violations of this subchapter, the
[Direetor-of-Code-Enforecement] City Manager his ~~ he~ dc~"nee, shall give
notice that unless the violations are corrected within a reasonable period of time, the
certificate of occupancy will be revoked, subject to appeal before the Local Board of
Housing, Building, and Construction Appeals.

Section 3

Section 152.21 of the Covington Code of Ordinances is hereby amended to read as
follows:

§ 152.21 AMENDMENTS TO CODE.

The following sections and subsections are hereby revised as stated below:

Section 101.1. Title. Insert “City of Covington, Kentucky” for name of jurisdiction.
Section 102.3 Application of other codes. This subsection is replaced as follows:

“Repairs, additions, or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy, shall be done
in accordance with procedures and provisions of the Kentucky Building Code, Kentucky
Residential Code, Kentucky Plumbing Code, Kentucky Mechanical Code, Kentucky
Standards of Safety, National Fire Code, and the National Electric Code, as well as any
other codes adopted by the Commonwealth of Kentucky now and in the future. Nothing
in this Code shall be construed to cancel, modify, or set aside any provision of the Zoning
Code for the City of Covington, Kentucky.”

Section [102+4]102.7 Referenced Codes and Standards. This subsection is
replaced as follows:

"The codes and standards referenced in this code shall be those that are listed in 107.1 and
considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such
reference. Where differences occur between provisions of this code and the referenced
standards, the provisions of this code shall apply.

Section 103.1 General. This subsection is replaced as follows:

“The City of Covington [Cede-Enfoereement-Department] Neighborhood Services

Department shall be responsible for the enforcement of the Property Maintenance

Code. [The Code-Enforeement-Department Director—and-]Code Enforcement Officers

who = 1we been designated appropriately under state and local laws shall be
known as “code officials” under this Code.”




Section 103.2 Appointment. This subsection is not adopted.

Section 103.3 Deputies. This subsection is not adopted.

Section [163:6]103.5 Fees. This subsection is not adopted. See [§t56-12] §92.99 for
a fee schedule.

Section 106.2 Notice of violation. The heading of this subsection and the subsection
itself are replaced as follows:

“Section 106.2 Violations of the Property Maintenance Code; notice of violation, citations,
appeals, and liens.










A code official shall carry out all Property Maintenance Code actions
in_accordance with the legal requirements adopted by the City of
Covington regarding code enfc—-2ment procedures, set forth in

Chapter 92 of the City of Covington Code of Ordinances and based on
applicable Kentucky laws.

Section 106.3 Prosecution of violation. [The heading-of-this-subsection—and-the]
This subsection [itselfare] is replaced as follows:




A code official shall carry out all Property Maintenance Code actions

in accordance with the legal requirements adopted by the City of
Covington regarding code enforcement procedures, set forth in
Chapter 92 of the City of Covington Code of Ordinances and based on
applicable Kentucky laws.

Section 106.4 Violation penalties. [Thissubseetion-isnot-adepted:] This heading

and subsection are replaced with the following;:
“Section 106.. Penalties “~r violation of Property Maintenance Code.

(1) A violation of this code shall constitute a civil offense, and any
person, firm, or corporation who violates any provision of this
subchapter shall be subject to a civil fine identified in Section 92.99 of
the Covington Code ¢f "rdinances, or the cost to the City of Covington
to abate the violation, or both.

(2) The City of Covington shall possess a lien on property for all fines,
penalties, charges, attorney’s fees and other reasonable costs
associated with enforcing this code and placing of a lien on the parcel
of real property pursuant to this code. The lien shall be superior to and
have priority over all other liens, except state, county, school board,
and city taxes if all legal requirements are satisfied.

[Seeti I £ violationThiscul .. ] i .

SECTION 107 NOTICES AND ORDERS. This heading is replaced with the following
heading;:

“SECTION 107 VIOLATIONS OF STATE CODES”



Section 107.1 Notice to [ewner-or-to] person [er-persens] responsible. The
heading of this subsection and the subsection itself are replaced as follows:

Section 107.1 Violations of the state codes; citation, appeals, and liens.

“Code officials may issue citation(s) for violation(s) of the Kentucky Building Code,
Kentucky Standards of Safety, Kentucky Plumbing Code, Kentucky Residential Code,
Kentucky Mechanical Code, National Fire Code, and the National Electric Code (“state
codes”). Citations shall be issued in the same manner as set forth in subsection 106.2(4)
and (5) and penalties may be imposed as set forth in subsection 106.3. To appeal a citation
finding a violation of a state code, the alleged violator may appeal the citation pursuant to
[§352.03] Char*~-92 0“**~ "r--~1gton 7~ e of Ordinances.”

Section 107.2 Form. This section is not adopted.
Section 107.3 Method of service. This section is not adopted.

Section [+674]107.5 Penalties. This section is not adopted.

[Seetion1075-—Transfer-of-ow
107-2-and-adepted-in-its-entirety:]

Section 108.3 Notice. This subsection is replaced as follows:

A-l--'l a¥s AvalVa at - alsaTalllVaVataVaVatashaVa¥a T~

A ~ade ~fficial shall give notice of any enforcement actions arising from the

Property Maintenance Code in _accordance with the legal requirements
adopted by the City of Covington regarding code enforcement procedures,
Tt Lootl Sen ML mmtap ~a ~fa2l~ Oity ~f Covingtc— “ade of Ordinances and
based on appiicabte Kentucky taws.

Section 108.4 Placarding. This subsection is replaced as follows:

“With respect to structures that violate this subsection, upon failure of the owner or
person responsible to comply with the notice provisions within the time given, the code
official shall post on the premises a placard bearing the following language:

9



This building is unfit for human habitation, occupancy, or use; the use or occupation of
this building for human habitation, occupancy, or use is prohibited and unlawful.

With respect to defective equipment, upon failure of the owner or person responsible to
comply with the notice provisions within the time given, the code official shall post on the
equipment a placard that the equipment is defective and should not be used and/or may
have the equipment rendered inoperable until such time as it complies with this Code.”

Section 108.4.1 Placard Removal. This subsection is replaced as follows:

“The code official shall remove the above-referenced placard whenever the defect or
defects upon which the placarding action were based have been eliminated. Any person
who defaces or removes a condemnation placard without the approval of the code official
shall be deemed guilty of a class “A” misdemeanor and subject to immediate arrest and
applicable fines.”

Section 108.5 Prohibited occupancy. This subsection is replaced as follows:

“Any person who shall occupy a placarded premises or shall operate placarded
equipment, and any owner or any person responsible for the premises who shall let
anyone occupy a placarded premises or operate placarded equipment shall be deemed
guilty of a class “A” misdemeanor and subject to immediate arrest and applicable fines.”

Section 109.5 Costs of emergency repairs. This subsection shall be revised to read
as follows:

“Cost incurred in the performance of emergency work shall by paid by the City. The City
may recover these costs by filing a lien on the property on which the emergency work was
performed and it may recover these costs by foreclosing on this lien or by taking other
appropriate legal action.”

Section 109.6 Hearing. This subsection is replaced as follows:

“Any person ordered to take emergency measures shall comply with such order
immediately in accordance with the City of Covington Code of Ordinances and
applicable Kentucky law. Any affected person may [shall,-within-7daysafter-an
erder—is—issued—under—this—Seetion;] appeal a citation and [the] order to take
emergency measures to the Code Enforcement Board pursuant to Chapter 92 of the
Covington Code of Ordinances_and any applicable Kentucky law. All relevant
portions of Chapter 92 of the Covington Code of Ordinances shall apply with regard to the
filing and hearing of an appeal to the Code Enforcement Board and any subsequent appeal
authorized by law.”

‘ion1  :Notic sar "¢ * 's.Thissection 1s replaced as follows:
Section1o8-3"|

A code official shall give notice of any enforcement actions arising from the
Property Maintenance Code in accordance with the legal requirements
adopted by the City of Covington regarding code enforcement procedures,
set forth in Chapter 92 of the City of Covington Code of Ordinances and
based on applicable Kentucky laws.

10



110.4. Salvage materials. This section is replaced as follows:

“When any structure has been ordered demolished and removed, the City Board of
Commissioners or other designated officer under said contract or arrangement shall have
the right -- but is not required -- to sell the salvage and valuable materials at the highest
price obtainable. The net proceeds of such sale, after deducting the expenses of such
demolition and removal and after the payment of any liens, fines, or taxes owed on the
property, shall be promptly remitted with a report of such sale or transaction, including
the items of expense and the amounts deducted, for the person who is entitled thereto,
subject to any order of a court. If such a surplus does not remain to be turned over, the
report shall so state.”

Section 111 Means of appeal. This section and all following subsections or
subchapters shall not be adopted.

Section 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS.

The definition of “CODE OFFICIAL” is revised to read as follows:

“CODE OFFICIAL. A code enforcement officer or other official who is charged with the
administration and enforcement of this code, or any duly authorized representative.”

Section [363-14]304.14 Insect screens. The two dates to be inserted in this
subsection are April 3o0th and October 31st.

Section [365]208 RUBBISH AND GARBAGE.

tellowingtrash-colleetion1.308 is hereby replaced with thé foll.ou.Jinq:

All ow— -~ ~nd occupants in the City sh~"" follow applicable solid waste and
recycling ru’ A=agulr*ns, as set forth in ~" apter 95 of the Covington
Code of Ordinances.

Section [366:3]7 ~ 1.3 Single occupant. This subsection is replaced as follows:
“Section [366:3] ~~~.3 Single occupant. Both the owner and the occupant of a one-

family dwelling or of a single-tenant nonresidential structure shall be jointly and severally
liable and/or responsible for extermination on the premises.”

Section [366.5] 209.3 Occupant. This subsection is replaced as follows:

11



“Section [366-5] 30~ 7 Occupant. Both the owner and the occupant of any structure

shall be jointly and severally liable and/or responsible for the continued rodent and pest-
free condition of the structure.

Exception: Where the infestations are caused by defects in the structure, the owner shall
be solely responsible for extermination.”

Section 601.1 Scope. This subsection is replaced as follows:

“Section 601.1 Scope. The provisions of this subchapter, Chapter 150 of the City Code
of Ordinances, and Appendix “A” to Chapter 150 of the Code all shall govern the minimum
mechanical and electrical facilities and equipment to be provided.”

Section 602.1 Facilities Required. This heading and subsection are replaced
as follows:

Section 602.1 Heating Facilities. Heating facilities shall be provided in structures as
required by this section. Every residential and commercial occupancy shall have a
permanent heat source. A permanent heat source is one in which the power source is
either hard wired or piped into the appropriate utility.

Section 602.3 Heat supply. The two dates to be inserted in this subsection are
September 30 and May 31.

Section 602.4 Occupiable work spaces. The two dates to be inserted in this
subsection are September 30 and May 31.

Section 604.2 Service. This subsection is replaced as follows:

"The size and usage of appliances and equipment shall serve as a basis for determining
the need for additional facilities in accordance with the National Electric Code. Dwelling
units shall be served by a three wire, 120/140 volt, single phase electrical service having a
rating of not less than 60 amperes."

Section 701.1 Scope. This subsection is replaced as follows:

“Section 701.1 Scope. The provisions of this subchapter and Chapter 151 of the City Code
of Ordinances shall govern the minimum conditions and standards for fire safety relating
to structures and exterior premises, including fire safety facilities and equipment to be
provided.”

Section 4

Sections 152.40 through 152.44 of the Covington Code of Ordinances, which read
as follows, are repealed:

[HC SINGDIE UMINA..ON







14



15



16



17



18



Section 5

Section 152.99 of the Covington Code of Ordinances is amended to read as follows:

§ 152.99 PENALTY.

(A) Any person who violates any, provision, rule or regulation made under § 152.04, or
who induces another to violate any provision, rule or regulation of this section, on
conviction shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be fined not less than $25
nor more than $500, or confined in the county jail for not more than 60 days, or both.
Each day such violations exist shall, in the discretion of the courts, be considered as a
separate offense.

[E}](B) It shall be unlawful for any [Any] owner, resident, user or occupier of a
house or tenement 1n the c1ty [fiﬂhﬂg] to f_all to comply with the prov151ons of§ 152 80[e¥

sepa—m—t&ef-feﬂ»se] Anu violation of § 152.80 shall be a civil offense, subject to

enforcement through Chapter 92 of the Covington Code of Ordinances and
the penalties and processes en--—~~atc- therein.

[5]1(C) In addition to or in the alternative of the penalty set forth in division (A) above,
the city may impose a civil penalty of not less than $250 or more than $500 on any person,

19



firm, or corporation violating the provisions of this chapter, as authorized under KRS
83.0635, and for purposes of calculating the civil penalty, each day that the person, firm or
corporation violates this or any provision thereof may be deemed a separate offense.

Section 6

..1is Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force from and after its passage,
publication, which may be in summary form, and recording, according to the law.

'geepph (

OR !

ATTEST:

_(Second Reading)

___(First Reading)

20






